*BID TABULATION SHEET*

Name of Contracting Officer: Mr. Arthur Smalls

FC-8023 PROJECT TITLE: Citywide Wrecker Services

DATE: May 27, 2015

TOTAL NUMBER OF BIDS: 7

Buckhead Towing

Group 1: No Bid
Group 2: $105.00
Group 3: No Bid
~ Group 4: $50.00

5 & W Towing

Group I: $265.00
Group 2: $100.00
Group 3: $475.00
Group 4: §75.00

B & L Wrecker Service, Ine.

Group 1: $No Bid
Group 2: $60.00
Group 3: No Bid
Group 4: $65.00

Futo’s, Inc.

Group 1: Neo Bid
Group 2: $50.00
Group 3: No Bid
Group 4: $25.00

South Metro Towing, Inc.

Group 1: $250.00
Group 2: $50.09
Group 3: $1,225.60
Group 4: $100.00

Mocody’s Wrecker Services

Group 1: No Bid
Group 2: $50.00
Group 3: Neo Bid
Group 4: $100.60

A Tow Atlanta, Ine.

Group 1: No Bid
Group 2: $52.00
Group 3: No Bid
Group 4: $45.00

THE RESULTS RECEIVED IN RESPONSE TO THIS SOLICITATION DO NOT REFLECT AWARD OF THIS CONTRACT. RESPONSES WILL

BE FURTHER EVALUATED BY THE CITY OF ATLANTA.




